
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 17-0012

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Fire Hydrant Repair Parts

TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2017)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 15, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 - American Darling Fire Hydrant Parts

10 ea. UNIT 

Coupling, breakable rod, material gray iron, used for 5 1/4" PRICE 30.86 NO BID NO BID

1. Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-30, SAWS #10984 TOTAL 308.60

5 set UNIT 

Coupling, cotter pins, size 8" x 15", Range A 8.50-9.37, material PRICE 11.47 NO BID NO BID

2. stainless steel used for 5 1/4" & 6", 2 each set Brand B62B, Part #54-62-29-31, SAWS #11008 TOTAL 57.35

5 ea. UNIT 

Flange, breakable, material cast iron, used for 5-1/4", brand B-84-B, PRICE 30.86 NO BID NO BID

3. Part# 84-29-15, SAWS #12368 TOTAL 154.30

5 ea. UNIT 

Gasket, barrel, material composition rubber, used for 5-1/4", Model B62B, PRICE 5.88 NO BID NO BID

4. Part #54-62-38-1, SAWS #12670 TOTAL 29.40

UNIT 

20 ea. PRICE 109.98 NO BID NO BID

5. Kit, breakaway 1985 and old, used for 5-1/4" includes 8 bolts, Model B62B, SAWS #13302 TOTAL 2,199.60

UNIT 

3 ea. PRICE 169.30 NO BID NO BID

6. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, SAWS #13325 TOTAL 507.90

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 148.67 NO BID NO BID

7. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-250, SAWS #13317 TOTAL 1,486.70

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 127.33 NO BID NO BID

8. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model B84B-250, SAWS #13328 TOTAL 1,273.30

 UNIT 

50 ea. PRICE 99.14 NO BID NO BID

9. Kit, fire hydrant, traffic, used for 5 1/4", includes 8 bolts, Model B84B-250, SAWS #13339 TOTAL 4,957.00

15 ea. UNIT 

Kit, traffic repair quick fix, used for 5 1/4", includes flange, Model B62B, PRICE 97.76 NO BID NO BID

10. Part #B55204-KIT, SAWS #13386 TOTAL 1,466.40

20 ea. UNIT 

Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, used for fire hydrant repair, Model B-84-B, PRICE 159.20 NO BID NO BID

11. MFG Part #03KIT 1 051, SAWS #13332 TOTAL 3,184.00

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 68.00 NO BID NO BID

12. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B N.S., Mfg Part #03KIT 1 050, SAWS #13331 TOTAL 680.00

UNIT 

25 ea. PRICE 68.00 NO BID NO BID

13. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-62-B O.S., Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 050, SAWS #13330 TOTAL 1,700.00

UNIT 

15 ea. PRICE 159.20 NO BID NO BID

14. Overhaul kit, free hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Mfg. Part #03KIT 1 051, SAWS #13333 TOTAL 2,388.00

15 ea. UNIT 

Pin, coupling, kit used for 5", Model B-50-B, A-159621-5 H525 62/H600 PRICE 7.78 NO BID NO BID

15. 84 F/1-1/4 SQ, SAWS #14650 TOTAL 116.70

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 2.82 NO BID NO BID

16. O-Ring nozzle, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #84-20-4, SAWS #14149 TOTAL 28.20

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 311.10 NO BID NO BID

17. Seal, hydrant seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B-84-B, Part #84-35-02, SAWS #15780 TOTAL 3,111.00

UNIT 

15 ea. PRICE 317.60 NO BID NO BID

18. Seat, hydrant, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #62-35-OR, SAWS #15875 TOTAL 4,764.00

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 333.19 NO BID NO BID

19. Seat, hydrant, material bronze B763 Alloy844, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-35-02, SAWS #15874 TOTAL 1,665.95

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 46.02 NO BID NO BID

20. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-41, SAWS #17188 TOTAL 460.20

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 90.93 NO BID NO BID

21. Valve, hydrant, material rubber, used for 6", Model B84B, Part #60-84-41, SAWS #17189 TOTAL 454.65

UNIT 

2 ea. PRICE 46.02 NO BID NO BID

22. Valve, main, used for 5 1/4", Model B84B, Part #B56637, SAWS #17196 TOTAL 92.04
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UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 7.96 NO BID NO BID

23. Washer, thrust, material nylatron, used for 5 1/4", Model B62B, Part #54-62-4-4, SAWS #17431 TOTAL 39.80

  

* NO BID NO BID

 TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL 31,125.09

GROUP 2 - Clow Fire Hydrant Parts   

10 ea. UNIT 

Coupling, safety stem, material steel tubing used for 5 1/4", brand Medallion, PRICE 29.39 NO BID NO BID

1. Part #M-10/M-220-2349, SAWS #11190 TOTAL 293.90

 UNIT 

5 set PRICE 35.27 NO BID NO BID

2. Flange, safety, material ductile iron, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-46/I-160-0808, SAWS #12397 TOTAL 176.35

UNIT 

50 ea. PRICE 114.14 NO BID NO BID

3. Kit, breakaway, size 5 1/4", used for breakflange repair, Model F2500, Part #R1620545, SAWS #13303 TOTAL 5,707.00

UNIT 

50 ea. PRICE 262.36 NO BID NO BID

4. Kit, extension, size 12", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620665, SAWS #13324 TOTAL 13,118.00

UNIT 

50 ea. PRICE 222.00 NO BID NO BID

5. Kit, extension, size 6", used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620664, SAWS #13327 TOTAL 11,100.00

UNIT 

75 ea. PRICE 103.09 NO BID NO BID

6. Kit, safety flange, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #R1620653, SAWS #13366 TOTAL 7,731.75

UNIT 

4 ea. PRICE 97.71 NO BID NO BID

7. Nut, operating, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-3, SAWS #14287 TOTAL 390.84

UNIT 

100 ea. PRICE 80.18 NO BID NO BID

8. Overhaul kit, fire hydrant, size 5 1/4", Model Medallion, 02KIT, 1 051, SAWS #13334 TOTAL 8,018.00

5 ea. UNIT 

Pin, safety coupling, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, PRICE 2.86 NO BID NO BID

9. Part, #M-11/T0400891, SAWS #14678 TOTAL 14.30

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 2.80 NO BID NO BID

10. O-Ring, operating nut, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-1/T-240-0815, SAWS #14473 TOTAL 14.00

UNIT 

10 ea. PRICE 2.29 NO BID NO BID

11. O-Ring, safety flange, material N B R, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-47, SAWS #14477 TOTAL 22.90

 UNIT 

60 ea. PRICE 289.96 NO BID NO BID

12. O-Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-19/F-1600805, SAWS #15394 TOTAL 17,397.60

UNIT 

30 ea. PRICE 5.94 NO BID NO BID

13. O-Ring, seat upper, material NBR, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-18/T-240-0722, SAWS #14479 TOTAL 178.20

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 106.89 NO BID NO BID

14. Stem, upper, used for 5 1/4", Brand Medallion, Part #M-7, SAWS #16273 TOTAL 534.45

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 118.93 NO BID NO BID

15. Valve, lower plate, material brass, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-24/M1600801, SAWS #17194 TOTAL 594.65

UNIT 

30 ea. PRICE 47.20 NO BID NO BID

16. Valve, main, material rubber used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-21/T-160-0802, SAWS #17309 TOTAL 1,416.00

25 ea. UNIT 

Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, Part #M-17/F-160-0803 PRICE 160.53 NO BID NO BID

17. SAWS #17315 TOTAL 4,013.25

2 ea. UNIT 

Washer, lower valve plate lock, material stainless steel, used for 5 1/4", Model Medallion, PRICE 1.73 NO BID NO BID

18. Part #M-22, SAWS #17413 TOTAL 3.46

 

* NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 70,724.65

GROUP 3 - MUELLER FIRE HYDRANT PARTS UNIT 

40 ea. PRICE 426.87 NO BID NO BID

1. Kit, main repair, used  for 5-1/4", Model Improved, SAWS #13350 TOTAL 17,074.80
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100 ea. UNIT 

Kit, Safety Flange Repair, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurions & Improved NS, PRICE 100.80 NO BID NO BID

2. Part #A301, SAWS #13367 TOTAL 10,080.00

UNIT 

2 ea. PRICE 37.46 NO BID NO BID

3. Nut, hold down, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-4, SAWS #14234 TOTAL 74.92

10 ea. UNIT 

Nut, operating, used for 5-1/4", brand open right/1988 or later, Model Centurion, PRICE 117.94 NO BID NO BID

4. Part #A-1/147814, SAWS #14282 TOTAL 1,179.40

UNIT 

100 ea. PRICE 74.40 NO BID NO BID

5. Overhaul kit, size 5 1/4", Model Centurion, Part #01KIT 1 051, SAWS #14497 TOTAL 7,440.00

UNIT 

15 ea. PRICE 1.00 NO BID NO BID

6. Pin, Cotter, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-29, SAWS #14646 TOTAL 15.00

UNIT 

5 ea. PRICE 1.59 NO BID NO BID

7. Plug, Oil Filler, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-7, SAWS #14943 TOTAL 7.95

UNIT 

25 ea. PRICE 3.18 NO BID NO BID

8. O-Ring, Bottom Seat, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-44/142893, SAWS #15363 TOTAL 79.50

UNIT 

60 ea. PRICE 172.93 NO BID NO BID

9. Ring, Seat, Material Bronze, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-43/142764, SAWS #15388 TOTAL 10,375.80

 UNIT 

15 ea. PRICE 114.36 NO BID NO BID

10. Valve, Upper Plate, Material Bronze, used for 5-1/4", Model Centurion, Part #A-36/184055, SAWS #17312 TOTAL 1,715.40

 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 48,042.77

GROUP 4 - M&H Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT 

15 ea. PRICE 76.70 NO BID NO BID

1. Kit, Breakaway, used for 5-1/4", Model 129, SAWS #13300 TOTAL 1,150.50

 *

 NO BID NO BID

 TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 1,150.50

GROUP 5 - U.S. PIPE FIRE HYDRANT PARTS  

20 ea. UNIT

Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4" fire hydrant, Brand Metropolitan, Model 250 M-94 PRICE 88.00 NO BID NO BID

1. (Yr. 94 & after), Part #658665, SAWS #13383 TOTAL 1,760.00

UNIT

15 ea. PRICE 100.00 NO BID NO BID

2. Overhaul, kit, size 5 1/4", Model Metropolitan 250, Part #07KIT 1 525 052, SAWS #14502 TOTAL 1,500.00

2 ea. UNIT

Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 /14", Brand Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan PRICE 234.96 NO BID NO BID

3. 250 M-94, Part #42, SAWS #15395 TOTAL 469.92

5 ea. UNIT

O-Ring, seat, material rubber, used for 5 1/4", Brand Year 1994 and on Model Metropolitan PRICE 2.31 NO BID NO BID

4. 250 M-94, Part #43, SAWS #15399 TOTAL 11.55

5 ea. UNIT

Valve, main, material rubber, used for 5 1/4" Yar 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan 250 M-94, PRICE 64.11 NO BID NO BID

5. Part #44, SAWS #17200 TOTAL 320.55

 UNIT

5 ea. PRICE 154.06 NO BID NO BID

6. Valve, main, material rubber Buna-S, used for 5 1/4", Model H-205 USP hydrant, Part #H-44, SAWS #17207 TOTAL 770.30

5 ea. UNIT

Valve, upper plate, material bronze, used for 5 1/4" Year 1994 and on, Model Metropolitan PRICE 230.88 NO BID NO BID

7. 250 M-94, Part #35, Lawson #17317 TOTAL 1,154.40

 

* NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 5,986.72

GROUP 6 - Kennedy Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT  

6 ea. PRICE 15.21 NO BID NO BID

1. Facing, drain valve, material Buna N, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8137, SAWS #11863 TOTAL 91.26

3
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UNIT

75 ea. PRICE 96.00 NO BID NO BID

2. Kit, collision, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K-8149/1585C00R1X81Z, SAWS #13306 TOTAL 7,200.00

UNIT

15 ea. PRICE 209.03 NO BID NO BID

3. Kit, extension, size 12", Model K81A, SAWS #13321 TOTAL 3,135.45

5 ea. UNIT

Nozzle, remover tool, size 2 1/2" wrench hose, used for 5 1/4", Brand K81A, Part #K-8148/3310372 PRICE 90.63 NO BID NO BID

4. SAWS #14156 TOTAL 453.15

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 147.80 NO BID NO BID

5. Nut, operating stem, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8102, SAWS #14292 TOTAL 147.80

UNIT

30 ea. PRICE 115.06 NO BID NO BID

6. Overhaul kit, size 5 1/4", Model guardian K81A, Part #05KIT 1 050, SAWS #13338 TOTAL 3,451.80

UNIT

10 ea. PRICE 197.24 NO BID NO BID

7. Ring, seat, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8128, SAWS #15392 TOTAL 1,972.40

UNIT

10 ea. PRICE 59.87 NO BID NO BID

8. Valve, main, material neoprene, used for 5 1/4", Model K81, Part #K8131, SAWS #17198 TOTAL 598.70

UNIT

10 ea. PRICE 170.31 NO BID NO BID

9. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8136, SAWS #17308 TOTAL 1,703.10

UNIT

15 ea. PRICE 170.31 NO BID NO BID

10. Valve, drain, material bronze, used for 5 1/4", Model K81A, Part #K8136/3316142, SAWS #17307 TOTAL 2,554.65

 

 NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 21,308.31

GROUP 7 - Waterous Fire Hydrant Parts UNIT  

10 ea. PRICE 110.01 NO BID NO BID

1. Kit, traffic repair, used for 5 1/4", Model Pacer, Part #K528/AFTER June 1980, SAWS #13382 TOTAL 1,100.10

UNIT

1 ea. PRICE 879.30 NO BID NO BID

2. Pipe, lower standpipe, Brand Pacer, SAWS #14813 TOTAL 879.30

 

* NO BID NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 1,979.40

GROUP 8 - Watermaster Hydrant Parts

Watermaster Main Valve Repair Kit (Item 3) to include the following:

weather seal o-ring #94656 (1 ea), thrust washers #946517 (2 ea), reservoir o-rings #946565 (2 ea.)

quad rings #946440 *1 ea), inserts valve seat #946521 (2 ea), valve seat o-rings #946568 (2 ea.), 

seating valve rubber #946526 (1 ea.)

UNIT   

10 ea. PRICE 212.80 232.00 NO BID

1. Kit, Extension, Size 6", Model: EJ, 5BR250/CD250, EJ# 946450, SAWS #46149 TOTAL 2,128.00 2,320.00

UNIT   

15 ea. PRICE 248.80 269.00 NO BID

2. Kit, Extension, Size 12", Model: EJ, 5BR250/CD250, EJ #946452, SAWS #46150 TOTAL 3,732.00 4,035.00

 UNIT   

15 ea. PRICE 115.22 106.00 NO BID

3. Kit, Main Valve, include rubber interior parts, Model: EJ 5BR250/CD250, EJ #946450, SAWS #46151 TOTAL 1,728.30 1,590.00

UNIT   

10 ea. PRICE 138.06 122.00 NO BID

4. Kit, Break Flange Part # EJ 946345, SAWS #46152 TOTAL 1,380.60 1,220.00

UNIT   

10 ea. PRICE 26.80 26.00 NO BID

5. Nut, Operating Stem, Material Brass, Model EJ BR7-B #646519, SAWS #46153 TOTAL 268.00 260.00

UNIT   

30 ea. PRICE 138.89 120.00 NO BID

6. Seat, Valve Material, Brass, Model EJ 5BR3 VLV Seat/AD EJ #946495, SAWS #46154 TOTAL 4,166.70 3,600.00

UNIT   

10 ea. PRICE 3.09 3.00 NO BID

7. Insert Rubber Seat, Model EJ BR21R RUB INS EJ #946521, SAWS #46155 TOTAL 30.90 30.00

UNIT   

10 ea. PRICE 24.27 24.00 NO BID

8. Washer Valve, Main, Model EJ 5BR10-C DI NUT EJ #946538, SAWS #46156 TOTAL 242.70 240.00

*

NO BID

TOTAL GROUP 8 TOTAL 13,677.20 13,295.00
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TOTAL AWARD TOTAL 110,966.36 13,295.00

EXTENSION 1 110,966.36 13,295.00

EXTENSION 2 110,966.36 13,295.00

EXTENSION 3 110,966.36 13,295.00

EXTENSION 4

Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days

Delivery Days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

Act Pipe & Supply Demandstar

Corix Water Products SAWS Website

Ferguson Waterworks

Fortiline Waterworks  

HD Supply

Hydroflo  
Moore Supply  

Morrison Supply

Quality Hydrant
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